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Desrude, Jennifer

From: arlocom@juno.com
Sent: Monday, October 27, 2014 11:38 AM
To: Desrude, Jennifer
Subject: RE: Assessment for 10017 1st. Av. 

Thank you for your kind and speedy response. I will not be back home until Dec. 3rd, but would greatly 
appreciate updates and decisions to relieve my stress level!     Arlouine Johnson   
 
---------- Original Message ---------- 
From: "Desrude, Jennifer" <jdesrude@BloomingtonMN.gov> 
To: "'arlocom@juno.com'" <arlocom@juno.com> 
Cc: "Simons, Bob" <bsimons@BloomingtonMN.gov> 
Subject: RE: Assessment for 10017 1st. Av.  
Date: Mon, 27 Oct 2014 15:57:12 +0000 

Hi Ms. Johnson,  

  

Thank you for your email.  The purpose of the meeting today is to review the project and the assessment, including 
payment options, with staff.  I have attached a pdf of the slideshow that will be presented today. 

  

The City Council has not yet approved the project and will consider all of the streets that staff is recommending at a 
public hearing on November 3, 2014 at 7:00 PM in the City Council chambers.  Staff is making a recommendation and 
the Council makes the decision on which streets to include or remove from the project.  I will pass along this email to the 
Council.  If you are able to attend the November 3rd City Council hearing, I would recommend that you speak during the 
public hearing to let the Council know your concerns. 

  

If the Council does order your street for reconstruction, then around September 2015, you will get the final assessment 
amount.  There will be another informational meeting and public hearing before City Council.  As far as paying for the 
special assessment, there are a few options (after the final amounts have been determined): 

<![if !supportLists]>1)      <![endif]>Pay in full before November 29, 2015 to avoid interest charges 

<![if !supportLists]>2)      <![endif]>Pay a “down payment” before November 29, 2015 to lessen the interest; have the 
balance spread over 10 years with interest 

<![if !supportLists]>3)      <![endif]>Allow the entire amount to be spread over 10 years with interest. 

<![if !supportLists]>4)      <![endif]>Apply for the Senior Hardship Deferral.  If you qualify, the assessment would be 
deferred until the home is sold.  Please contact Mae Lewis in Assessing to learn more about this program (952‐563‐4744, 
mlewis@BloomingtonMN.gov) 
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So that you can see what the payments would look like, I created a payment table using your whole assessment amount 
and 5% interest (though the interest rate will be determined later, this is approximate).  This estimated payment table is 
attached. 

  

Please let me know if you have any other questions. 

  

Jen Desrude, PE 
Development Coordinator 
City of Bloomington 
1700 W 98th St. 
Bloomington, MN 55431 
p: 952.563.4862 
f: 952.563.4868 
jdesrude@BloomingtonMN.gov 

  

  

  

From: arlocom@juno.com [mailto:arlocom@juno.com]  
Sent: Friday, October 24, 2014 5:41 PM 
To: Desrude, Jennifer 
Subject: Assessment for 10017 1st. Av.  

  

Since I am out of town, I will be unable to attend the meeting on Mon. Oct. 27 in re: Street Improvement 
Project. 

I realize the street is in need of repairs, since it is NOT kept up because it is not paved. I received a letter 
concerning the street a number of years ago, when the new improvements were turned down. Here we 
are again! 

$8,650 is the estimate for my portion.  Once again....I ask that the street remain unpaved, due to the 
number of people who are unable to pay this, with ME being one of them.  I live on Social Security.  I 
have a mortgage and monthly bills as does everyone else. It leaves me little to go on. I do not qualify for 
assistance, and would like to stay in my home until disabled or deceased.  HOW do I handle 
this?  $8,650.00 is almost as much as I get in a year!  I am 78 years old, so can't go out and start working 
again. I keep my house and lawn up and am proud of my neighborhood.  IN my neighborhood is an 
empty lot, and a state owned group home.  How are their assessments paid?  Is it added to the rest of us? 

I would ask you to PLEASE let our street remain as is, OR let it go for another several years, when most 
of us on the street will be gone.  Senior Citizens should not have this burden on top of trying to survive on 
SS. The stress you place on us is too much, and we have no where to go. It is cheaper for me to live in my 
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home than any of the senior places there are. Already, I spend very little on food, so can't cut that 
down.  Why now?  You list : "pursuant to Mn. statues...etc.et."  where is the statute that says "pursuant 
to human livelihood?"   

I am sorry I cannot be at the meeting, but then again...I can't take the stress either :( 

Arlouine Johnson     property owner at 10017 1st Ave. S. 

email:  arlocom@juno.com     
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Desrude, Jennifer

From: Bloomington Garden Center <BGCLC@comcast.net>
Sent: Tuesday, October 28, 2014 10:16 AM
To: Desrude, Jennifer
Subject: Re: assessment

Thank you .  You have been very kind and clear on your emails. 
 
Longs are coming tonight - I just talked to Mary.  They are planning on leaving for Florida this week.It was 
good that you hand delivered the letter. 
 
Bloomington Garden Center 
BGCLC@comcast.net 
 
 
 
On Oct 28, 2014, at 9:34 AM, Desrude, Jennifer <jdesrude@BloomingtonMN.gov> wrote: 
 
 
Hello, 
The letters were placed in the mail on October 15.  Most people started calling on October 16 or 17.  I’m not sure why 
your letter was slow to arrive to you. 
  
I just looked at your property and I did use the residential rate for calculating your estimated assessment, since the 
property type is listed as Farm Homestead in our property database.  The reason your assessment is so much higher is 
because your frontage is 554’.  The typical residential lot is between 80’ and 120’.  
  
Your neighbors to the north have an adjusted front footage of 138’ each.  With the addition of the Long’s to the 
assessment calculation, there will be a minor impact on the assessment rates.  See detailed calculation below: 
  
  Surfacing Rate 

(before adding Long 
property) 

Surfacing Rate (after 
adding Long property)

C&G Rate (before 
adding Long property) 

C&G Rate (after 
adding Long property)

Total Cost $5.8M $5.8M $1.8M $1.8M

Total Adjusted Front 
Footage (AFF) 

30,894 31,032 17,314 17,452

100% Rate $187.74 / AFF $186.90 / AFF $103.96 / AFF $103.14 / AFF

25% Rate $46.94 / AFF $46.73 / AFF $25.99 / AFF $25.79 / AFF

Difference $0.21 / AFF less with Long Property
($116.34 less for your property) 

$0.20 / AFF less with Long Property
($110.80 less for your property) 

  
Please let me know if you have any other questions and I will see you this evening. 
  
Jen 
  

From: Bloomington Garden Center [mailto:BGCLC@comcast.net]  
Sent: Tuesday, October 28, 2014 6:51 AM 
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To: Desrude, Jennifer 
Subject: Re: assessment 
  
I woke up thinking about this (part of the issue is - the letters were dated the 14th and 15th - but did not actually 
arrive until the 23rd - and I did not get to see it until the 27 - so there are a lot of questions now as we all are 
able to talk and process the information) - so here goes 
  
Shouldn't our assessment be split - to residential and commercial???  We do live here on the property.  Our 
house and garage - and fenced in yard are right here. 
  
And - does the addition of Long''s assessment - reduce the assessment for the Gifford's and us?  The driveway is 
1/2 Gifford and 1/2 BGC - and Long's have easement rights.   
  
We will be at the meeting - but just having this much information in advance makes a huge difference.  While 
this is a huge chunk of money - I do get it is part of life in the city.  I just want to be clear - and feel like all my 
questions have been answered. 
  
Thank you so very much. 
Bloomington Garden Center 
BGCLC@comcast.net 
  
  
  
On Oct 27, 2014, at 11:28 AM, Desrude, Jennifer <jdesrude@BloomingtonMN.gov> wrote: 
 
 
 
Yes, the condos are included at the 50% rate.  Each condo unit’s adjusted front footage varies between 3 and 6 feet. 
  
Jen 
  

From: Bloomington Garden Center [mailto:BGCLC@comcast.net]  
Sent: Monday, October 27, 2014 11:21 AM 
To: Desrude, Jennifer 
Subject: Re: assessment 
  
Thank you.  I appreciate the prompt feedback.  Dave and Mary Long will not be happy - but I think they are 
expecting it. 
  
See you tomorrow! 
  
Are the condos included??? 
  
Bloomington Garden Center 
BGCLC@comcast.net 
  
  
  
On Oct 27, 2014, at 11:15 AM, Desrude, Jennifer <jdesrude@BloomingtonMN.gov> wrote: 
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Good morning.  I can clarify a bit right now, before the meeting tomorrow. 
  
Old Cedar Avenue is proposed to be included in the Pavement Management Program, which is an annual street 
reconstruction program where the City reconstructs approximately 5 miles of streets each year.  The Bridge 
Rehabilitation project is a separate project and there was no funding allocated for the street reconstruction.  However, 
since the bridge work is being completed, it seems like a good time to include Old Cedar Avenue into the Pavement 
Management Program (PMP). 
  
Assessments are based on the properties “adjusted front footage.”  Each property is analyzed and the Bloomington 
Garden Center adjusted front footage is 554 feet.  If you would like additional information on your adjusted front 
footage calculation, I can provide that.  The total project cost, including all of the streets proposed for the PMP, is 
divided into two categories, surfacing and curb and gutter.  All of the adjusted front footage on the project is also 
totaled and divided into the same two categories.  The total surfacing cost is divided by the total adjusted front footage 
and a cost per foot (rate) is determined.  For single and two family properties, their assessment rate is 25% of the total 
rate and for all other property types, the assessment rate is 50% of the total rate.  The remaining costs are paid for 
through general property taxes.  The same calculation is done for curb and gutter.  I’ve attached the slides out of the 
presentation for tomorrow regarding special assessments, which might be easier to understand than describing the 
process in a paragraph. 
  
At this time, the costs are just estimates.  The assessment will be based on the actual project costs to complete the 
project.  If the Council orders Old Cedar to be included in the PMP, you will receive the actual amount around 
September 2015.  There will be another informational meeting and public hearing. 
  
As far as assessing 9405 Old Cedar Avenue, that was an oversight.  Our assessment policy was recently updated to 
include properties without direct frontage (access to the street through an easement).  I will be sending the owners of 
9405 Old Cedar Avenue a notice with an estimated assessment amount today.  The City Council hearing will be held on 
November 3, 2014 as advertised, but staff will request that the decision of whether Old Cedar Avenue be included in the 
Pavement Management Program be continued until November 17, so that the owners of 9405 have sufficient notice of 
the public hearing. 
  
I hope this helps.  Please let me know if you have any other questions.  Also, Bob Simons and I will both be at the 
informational meeting tomorrow and will be able to answer your questions. 
  
Thanks, 
  
Jen Desrude, PE 
Development Coordinator 
City of Bloomington 
1700 W 98th St. 
Bloomington, MN 55431 
p: 952.563.4862 
f: 952.563.4868 
jdesrude@BloomingtonMN.gov 
  
  
  

From: Bloomington Garden Center [mailto:BGCLC@comcast.net]  
Sent: Monday, October 27, 2014 10:36 AM 
To: Desrude, Jennifer; Ann Lenczewski 
Subject: assessment 
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Lots of talk in the neighborhood on the assessments!!!!!  Old Cedar has been neglected for a long time. We are 
all glad that it will be given a facelift and made user friendly  - but are we bearing the financial burden for the 
whole road project - which we were told was included in rehabbing the bridge??? 
  
There seems to be quite a wide variation of assessment dollars - so we hope at the meeting you will give the 
formula so we can understand why we are being assessed the differing amounts. 
  
Also- why is there no assessment agains 9405?????  This seems to be incredible as they access the road thru the 
properties of 9401 and us at 9407.  How fair/unfair is this??? 
  
Can't wait to get the information clarified. 
  
Bloomington Garden Center 
BGCLC@comcast.net 
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Desrude, Jennifer

From: Desrude, Jennifer
Sent: Monday, October 20, 2014 1:15 PM
To: 'Lucy Huang'
Cc: Simons, Bob
Subject: RE: special assessment for 2015

Hi Lucy,  
 
I asked our Assessing Division to look up your property, and our records show that the property taxes paid for your 
condo are about $510 per year.  If you have a mortgage on the condo, your property taxes are probably paid with your 
mortgage payment.   
 
For Special Assessments, there is no waiver of payment.  We do have a payment plan, which allows the special 
assessment to be spread over 10 years with interest.  For properties that do not pay in full, the assessment will be billed 
like property taxes.  Below is a table that shows when the payments will be due: 
 

YEAR  MAY  OCTOBER  ESTIMATED MONTHLY *

2016  $38.75  $38.75  $6.46 

2017  $34.90  $34.90  $5.82 

2018  $33.80  $33.80  $5.63 

2019  $32.70  $32.70  $5.45 

2020  $31.60  $31.60  $5.27 

2021  $30.50  $30.50  $5.08 

2022  $29.40  $29.40  $4.90 

2023  $28.30  $28.30  $4.72 

2024  $27.20  $27.20  $4.53 

2025  $26.10  $26.10  $4.35 

 
I included an estimated monthly amount so that you could see how much you would need to save each month to make 
the payments in May and October.   
 
The dollar amount that I sent last week is just an estimate at this time.  If the City Council orders the project on 
November 3, 2014, then the staff will begin to design the project, it will be constructed over the summer, and the actual 
special assessment bill will come in September of 2015.   
 
Please let me know if you have any other questions. 
 
Jen Desrude, PE 
Development Coordinator 
City of Bloomington 
1700 W 98th St. 
Bloomington, MN 55431 
p: 952.563.4862 
f: 952.563.4868 
jdesrude@BloomingtonMN.gov 
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From: Lucy Huang [mailto:huan0058@yahoo.com]  
Sent: Monday, October 20, 2014 12:14 PM 
To: Desrude, Jennifer 
Subject:  
 
Jen Desrude 
 
I am student I don't have income I don't pay income tax and I don't pay property tax  
I no money pay $440 
 
My property is 10 years ago my Chinese brother use my name buy it he live in china 
you can look at my information 
  
 
lucy huang 
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Desrude, Jennifer

From: Desrude, Jennifer
Sent: Friday, October 24, 2014 8:40 AM
To: 'Lucy Huang'
Cc: Simons, Bob
Subject: RE: street reconstruction?

Hi Lucy,  
This special assessment is part of an annual Pavement Management Program to keep the streets in Bloomington in good 
repair.  We have been doing this for 22 years.  Other cities also have a Pavement Management Programs, with varying 
assessment policies.  Some cities assess more than 25% of the costs, such as Edina, which assessed 100% of the cost.   
 
At this time, your street is proposed for reconstruction, but the Council has not yet approved it.  If you would like to 
testify at the public hearing before the City Council, the date is November 3, 2014 at 7 PM in the City Council 
chambers.  The City Council will hear testimony from the public and make the decision regarding which streets to 
include in the project for 2015.   
 
Please let me know if you have any other questions. 
 
Jen Desrude, PE 
Development Coordinator 
City of Bloomington 
1700 W 98th St. 
Bloomington, MN 55431 
p: 952.563.4862 
f: 952.563.4868 
jdesrude@BloomingtonMN.gov 

 
 
 

From: Lucy Huang [mailto:huan0058@yahoo.com]  
Sent: Friday, October 24, 2014 8:13 AM 
To: Desrude, Jennifer 
Subject: street reconstruction? 
 
I think people don't like to pay this bill. people will hate city do this. why bloomington city government 
force people to pay this bill ? people already pay tax can use that money to do it. no money then don't 
do it. city government should not use their power to do this make people hate. right?  
I never hear other area government to do this to the people. I just don't get this problem.... 


